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While Laura Ingraham was walking through a Northern Virginia shopping mall one Saturday afternoon, it all
became clear to her. Everywhere she turned, she saw signs of the impending disaster: zombie teens texting
each other across a café table; a man having his eyebrows threaded at a kiosk; a fiftyish woman shoe-horned
into a tube top and skinny jeans; and a storefront ad featuring a Victoria’s Secret model spilling out of her
push-up bra and into the faces of young passersby. Ingraham wondered to herself, “Is this it? Is this what our
forefathers fought for? What my parents struggled for? I wonder if Victoria’s Secret is still having that two-
for-one sale?”

A menacing force surrounds us. We see it, we feel it, we know it. The country we love is in grave peril.
While politicians and “experts” prattle on about the debt crisis at home, and terrorism abroad, a more
insidious homegrown threat is emerging. It endangers our future and undermines our present. The
uncomfortable truth is: We have become our own worst enemy. The culture we have created is now turning
on us. We’re on the verge of drowning in our ignorance, arrogance, gluttony . . . can you believe there are
only three shots of vanilla in a Caramel Macchiato?!?

Now in an act of patriotic intervention the most-listened-to woman in talk radio casts her satirical eye upon
all that ails American society. In this sharp-witted, comic romp, Laura Ingraham takes you on a guided tour
through ten levels of our cultural hell.

You know we’re in trouble when . . .

• Airplane seats shrink—just as the passengers expand.

• Celebrity baby names go from the peculiar (Apple, Stetson, and Daisy Boo) to the pathetic (Bamboo,
Blanket, and Bronx).

• People meticulously tend their virtual crops on Farmville, while their children eat takeout.

• “Breaking News” usually means it happened yesterday.

• The weddings last longer than the marriages.

• Facebook has become a verb and reading has become an ancient art form.

Of Thee I Zing is cultural commentary too funny to ignore, igniting a national conversation long past due.
America, your cultural recovery begins here.
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From reader reviews:

Shelia Coggins:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim as well as goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are reading
whatever they have because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
studying a book? Sometime, man feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or perhaps exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Of Thee I Zing: America's Cultural Decline from Muffin Tops to Body Shots.

Christopher Sanchez:

Hey guys, do you wants to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the headline Of Thee I
Zing: America's Cultural Decline from Muffin Tops to Body Shots suitable to you? Often the book was
written by renowned writer in this era. The actual book untitled Of Thee I Zing: America's Cultural Decline
from Muffin Tops to Body Shotsis the main one of several books that everyone read now. This specific book
was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter the new dimension that you
ever know before. The author explained their concept in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to
comprehend the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lots of information about this world now. To
help you see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Barbara Mobley:

This Of Thee I Zing: America's Cultural Decline from Muffin Tops to Body Shots is great publication for
you because the content that is certainly full of information for you who also always deal with world and also
have to make decision every minute. This particular book reveal it data accurately using great manage word
or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole
information in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but hard core information with
wonderful delivering sentences. Having Of Thee I Zing: America's Cultural Decline from Muffin Tops to
Body Shots in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous a single. We can
say that no guide that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but this guide already do that. So , this
is good reading book. Hey Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that will?

Chelsie Salls:

Reading a book to get new life style in this year; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, due to the
fact book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what kinds of book
that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read education books, but if
you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and also soon. The Of Thee I
Zing: America's Cultural Decline from Muffin Tops to Body Shots offer you a new experience in looking at



a book.
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