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The aim of this book is to familiarize the reader with fundamental topics in number theory: theory of
divisibility, arithmetrical functions, prime numbers, geometry of numbers, additive number theory,
probabilistic number theory, theory of Diophantine approximations and algebraic number theory. The author
tries to show the connection between number theory and other branches of mathematics with the resultant
tools adopted in the book ranging from algebra to probability theory, but without exceeding the
undergraduate students who wish to be acquainted with number theory, graduate students intending to
specialize in this field and researchers requiring the present state of knowledge.
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From reader reviews:

Tammi Kendrick:

The book Number Theory can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. So why
must we leave the great thing like a book Number Theory? Several of you have a different opinion about
reserve. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try
to closer with your book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you could give for each other; you can
share all of these. Book Number Theory has simple shape however, you know: it has great and big function
for you. You can seem the enormous world by wide open and read a reserve. So it is very wonderful.

Joseph Wilson:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
when those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is suitable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information we will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Number Theory as the daily resource information.

Mary Abrams:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of recommendations to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that
recommended for you is Number Theory this e-book consist a lot of the information of the condition of this
world now. This kind of book was represented how does the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that
writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some investigation when he makes this
book. That's why this book suitable all of you.

Frank Godwin:

A lot of guide has printed but it is different. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, witty, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known as of
book Number Theory. Contain your knowledge by it. Without leaving behind the printed book, it can add
your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about publication. It
can bring you from one destination for a other place.
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